
About the Authors 
 
J. Paul Lomio is Library Director and Lecturer in Law at Stanford Law School.  He holds both a U.S. 
Juris Doctor degree and an LL.M. degree in Law and Marine Affairs as well as a Masters of Library and 
Information Science. He was admitted to the Washington State Bar Association and was a member of 
the Gonzaga Law Review and has published several law review articles. He taught Resources in the Law 
at San Jose State University for ten years and currently teaches Advanced Legal Research at Stanford 
Law School.  He was appointed to the Law Librarians Advisory Committee for the California Office of 
Administrative Law, served a three-year term on the Association of American Law Schools Committee 
on Libraries and Technology and is a member of the Electronic Court Filing Task Force for the United 
States District Court, Northern District of California and currently serves as a member of the West 
Academic Advisory Board.  He has received several distinguished awards, including the Marshall D. 
O'Neill Award for “exceptional and enduring support of Stanford University's Research Enterprise.” 
This is his first book. See www.law.stanford.edu/library 

 
Henrik Spang-Hanssen is a Danish Supreme Court Attorney-at-law. Since 1998, he has worked as an 
independent senior researcher, including five years in the United States. He holds masters degrees in law 
from Copenhagen University in Denmark and Santa Clara University in California. He has clerked for 
the Chief Justice of the Supreme Court of Denmark. He has taught courses/seminars for paralegals and 
attorneys. He practiced law in his own law firm for over 15 years and worked as an external District 
Attorney in Appeals Courts in Denmark. He has been an elected member of the Attorney Disciplinary 
Board for the Copenhagen District. He has served as chairperson of a special committee on debt-
collecting businesses and been a member of the Danish Law Society’s committee concerning foreclosure 
auctions, debt-collecting businesses, bankruptcies and moratora. He has several times served as a judge 
at the international final rounds of the Phillip C. Jessup International Law Moot Court Competition in 
Washington, D.C. He is member of The American Society of International Law (ASIL) and an 
associated member of the American Bar Association. In addition, he has, written (in Danish ) the two 
fundamental books used by the Danish Law Society (Denmark’s bar association) and the Danish 
Attorney Disciplinary Board – “Advokatnævnet” (chaired by the Chief Justice of Denmark) - and three 
books (in English) on issues of public international law and cyberspace. He is regarded by many as an 
expert on the intersection of public international law and public international computer networks. See 
www.geocities.com/hssph. 

 
Both authors have taught university courses on legal research. 
 


